
Call to Artists
Creative Synergy
July 18, 2023 - August 19, 2023

Hosts and steering committee: Krystle Lisek, Linda Scheller, Brian Paris, Kaila Kindley, 
Blas Garcia, and Harry Davis

Are you ready to showcase your talent and take your art to the next level through 
collaboration with other artists? Join us at the Mistlin Gallery in downtown Modesto for a 
unique exhibit that will showcase the power of synergy in the arts.

This exhibition, “Creative Synergy,” is an opportunity for visual artists, sculptors, 
photographers, writers, poets, musicians, composers, dancers, and choreographers to 
come together, form teams, and develop unique blends of various artistic genres 
inspired by a common theme. Imagine the possibilities - a painting accompanied by a 
poem, a photograph paired with a pre-recorded music performance, or a 3D sculpture 
alongside a dance piece. The sky's the limit when it comes to combining your creative 
skills with those of your fellow artists.

To participate, artists should attend the dry mixer event on February 11, 2023, where 
they will have the opportunity to collaborate with other artists and form teams. Each 
team should appoint a group leader to compile their video proposal, which should not 
exceed 15 minutes in length, and should include an expectation of the size of the visual 
piece. Proposals should be submitted via a YouTube video link to 
ccaagallery@gmail.com by April 11, 2023.  Please check the instructions provided in 
regards to uploading unlisted videos to YouTube and proposal guidelines. After 
proposals have been reviewed, notification of acceptance will be sent out by April 28th, 
2023.

Submissions will be due by July 16th, 2023. The show will open on July 18th, 
2023. Artwalks will be held on July 20th and August 17th, 2023. Pick-up will be on 
August 20th, 2023 from 10am-3pm.

Submission Fees: $20 for visual artists, $15 for members, and $5 for all other 
participants. Submission fees will not be due until proposals have been approved.



During receiving for the show, visual pieces should be accompanied by QR codes for 
any audio/visual submissions. Poetry or writing to be included can be presented on 
quality paper or card stock.

Terms: The gallery reserves the right to not accept art that differs significantly from the 
submitted image and/ or is not properly prepared for installation. Entering this 
competition indicates agreement that images may be used for promoting the show.


